
II. The Situation in Venezuela  
 

Introduction 
 
Since 1999, Venezuela has been facing a complex situation characterized by institutional corruption, diminishing 

rights and freedoms, a humanitarian crisis, and a significant emigration of its citizens.1 Over the last twenty-five 
years, Venezuela has experienced an economic and social decline, which has intensified with the rise of the populist 
petrostate of present.2 However, this has not always been the case. Venezuela plays an important role in the global 

strategic oil market and is among the sixty-six Member States holding elections in 2024.3 The situation in Venezuela 
has drawn international attention and concern due to its far-reaching implications for the region, economic 

implications, and unintended consequences of mass migration.4  

 
Economic Concerns and Public Debt  

 
From 1958 until the mid-1990s, Venezuela was an established democracy and one of Latin America’s most 
urbanized and highly rich petroleum Member States.5 However, the Venezuelan economy has experienced numerous 

challenging inflection points, many of which were worsened by insufficient banking supervision and inadequate 
financial sector liberalization starting in the mid–1990s.6 In 1998, Hugo Chávez was elected president, introducing a 

redistributive policy aimed at reducing inequality through land reform and wealth development , reducing poverty, 
and increasing urban development, backed monetarily by the Petróleos de Venezuela, S.A (PDVSA), Venezuela’s 
national oil company.7 However, several policies, like internal corruption from PDVSA and strict central price 

controls, stiffed private industries and caused the Venezuelan Bolívar to lose its value and shortages of essential 
goods.8 In 2009, Chávez implemented a policy to consolidate power by removing presidential term limits and firing 
numerous skilled workers who took part in strikes and protests against PDVSA.9 As a result, Venezuela accrued 

more international debt as strategic petroleum reserves dwindled to critical levels.10  
 

From 2002 to 2008, access to public goods decreased further because of price controls and the global commodities 
supercycle.11 A technological or geopolitical shift often triggers a supercycle, where demand for necessary 
petroleum, agriculture, or metal items is high demand and exceeds the supply of the commodity, causing an increase 

in price and subsequent investment.12 During the following decade, there was rapid price inflation, deflation, 
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contractual breaches, and expropriation policies between PDVSA and oil companies.13 The state of economic affairs 
in Venezuela worsened.14 From 2005 to 2015, PDVSA subsidized oil for many Latin and South American Member 

States.15 While subsidizing, oil production was also reduced due to the loss of skilled labor and expropriation from 
oil companies in Venezuela.16  In 2014, global oil prices sharply declined, and Venezuela’s government struggled to 
stay out of financial default.17 Since 2005, the United States (US) has targeted sanctions on “Venezuelan individuals 

and entities that have engaged in criminal, antidemocratic, or corrupt actions,” including restrictions on entering 
financial deals and obtaining US visas.18 The 2013 Venezuelan Special Presidential Election helped to prompt 

another round of severe international sanctions by the European Union (EU) and the United Kingdom (UK) based 
on claims of corruption, unfair elections, and threats to opposition party leaders through arrest a nd removal.19 
Sanctions included excluding PDVSA from accessing US and European financial systems through oil imports.20 

Sanctions of such length and magnitude have had drastic consequences for Venezuela 's oil export market, as 
Venezuela heavily relies on its hydrocarbon sector, which constitutes twenty -five percent of its gross domestic 
product and ninety-five percent of its exports.21 Because of the decline in economic profit, in addition to sanctions, 

consumers' access to public goods and services has declined, raising health and sanitation issues.22   

 

The United Nations (UN) addressed to the political and economic situation within Venezuela, with the UN High 
Commissioner for Human Rights (UNCHR) expressing concern for the sanctions and increased economic strain 
created on the population.23  In 2019, Venezuela's Consumer Price Inflation (CPI) averaged 19,906 percent; in 2023, 

the annual CPI averaged 337.2 percent due to sustained hyperinflation, resulting in prices fluctuating quickly and 
people hoarding daily goods as they become scarce.24 The Venezuelan Bolívar also decreased in value, dropping 
eighty percent from 2013 to 2021.25 In 2021, Venezuela issued a new currency for its existing banknotes, taking 

higher paper notes off the market and changing how much each is worth, regardless of their previous known value, 
to boost the Bolívar cash economy instead of electronic or US dollar-based transactions.26 

 
Presidential Elections of 2013 and 2018 
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Immediately following the 2013 death of President Hugo Chávez, Vice President Nicolás Maduro took office as 

president.27 However, opposition party leaders boycotted his inauguration, arguing the National Assembly leader 
should have taken over as acting president under the Venezuelan Constitution and called for an election.28 On April 
14th, 2013, Venezuela held a special presidential election where Maduro claimed victory by a 1.49 percent margin.29 

The opposition did not accept the election results, alleging irregularities, and called for an audit of the electoral 
registry.30 The audit declared Maduro president.31 The special election of 2013, paired with several years of 

staggering inflation, triggered both domestic and international responses of discontent, claiming Maduro committed 
election fraud through consolidated power in the National Council and cutting out  access for opposition leaders.32  
 

The 2018 Presidential election set off a new wave of instability , as the National Constituent Assembly (NCA) 
banned and prosecuted several opposition opponents.33 Following the 2018 election, support for incumbent Maduro 
and opposition party leader Juan Guaidó divided Venezuela as to who was the legitimate President, following claims 

of election fraud and Maduro's divisive inauguration in 2013.34 Fifty-seven Member States officially recognized 
Guaidó as the President of Venezuela.35 In response to the 2018 election, the UN Secretary-General and the UN 

Security Council (SC) called for cooperation between political parties for the sake of the remaining population.36  
 
Humanitarian Concerns  

 
In 2019, the SC discussed the ongoing humanitarian situation in Venezuela.37 The SC expressed concerns about 
worsening humanitarian conditions worsening and the lack of access to necessary medical, sanitation, and clean 

water, and requested additional humanitarian funding and efforts.38 In October 2019, the UN Human Rights Council 
(HRC) established A/HRC/RES 42/25, an independent Fact-Finding Mission (FFM) in Venezuela to inspect claims 

of human rights violations that had taken place in the Member State since 2014.39 The FFM’s mandate was extended 
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through September 2024.40 Preliminary reports released from September to October 2023 indicate several high -
ranking officials were alleged to have targeted opposition parties to President Maduro.41 The report also states the 

Venezuelan government has repressed the rights of civilians through deprivation of life, enforced disappearances, 
arbitrary detentions, torture or degrading treatment of detainees, and gender-based violence.42 The UN Secretary-
General has requested additional support for health and nutrition within Venezuela and assistance with migrants 

from the HRC and the International Organization for Migration.43Approximately 7.7 million Venezuelans have fled 
to neighboring Latin or South American Member States, primarily Columbia and Peru.44 These migrating 

Venezuelans lack access to food, water, and typical health care and sanitation.45 As of April 2024, the humanitarian 
crisis involving the mass exodus of citizens and conditions for those who remain in Venezuela is worsening. 46 
Human Rights Watch reported in 2023, there are more than 270 political prisoners and 19 million people who need 

assistance.47 Over 72 percent of people were unable to access health services, and a decline in people being able to 
access medicine reached 26 percent in August 2023.48 
 

Recent Developments 
 

In October 2023, the Plataforma Unitaria Democrática (PUD), made up of Maduro and a group of opposition party 
leaders, signed the Barbados Agreement.49 The Barbados Agreement aimed to reform policies that target opposing 
parties.50 This included updated electoral registries, equal access to media for all nominees, and the National 

Electoral Council (NEC) was required to invite international poll monitors, which included delegations from the EU, 
UN, and African Union.51 If successful, the Barbados Agreement would ease sanctions many other Member States 
have imposed on Venezuela, including a temporary removal of sanctions on oil, natural gas, and gold by the US.52 

However, in May 2024, the NEC and the Venezuelan Supreme Court upheld the decision barring opposition leaders 
from running in the presidential primary on July 28th.53 This includes María Corina Machado, who won the 
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opposition party runoff, and Edmundo González Urrutia, who the PUD nominated.54 On July 28th, twelve million 
Venezuelans voted in the presidential election. 55 Maduro was declared president, though per the US’s Carter Center, 

there is missing polling data to support the election results.56 International monitors have stated “the electoral 
authority’s failure to announce disaggregated results by polling station constitutes a serious breach of electoral 
principles.”57 Several Member States have continued to question the fairness and results of the election.58 On 

September 9, 2024, reports stated the opposition party leader, Gonzalez, had left Venezuela for Spain after an 
warrant was issued for his arrest by Maduro’s government.59 This followed Gonzalez's allegations that Maduro had 

fraudulently won the election.60  
 
Several mass protests have occurred both in Venezuela and globally since the election result was revealed, and 

several Member States have also questioned the results of Maduro’s candidacy.61 Within Venezuela, armed pro-
government groups have reacted negatively to the protest against Maduro.62 Human Rights Watch has reported an 
uptick in arbitrary arrest, harassment, and unlawful deaths in the weeks leading up to and following the election.63  

Throughout August and September, demonstrations have ended with many injuries and twenty -three total civilian 
deaths.64 Human Rights Watch has credited the violence to the Venezuelan police force, national guard, and armed 

groups like Colectivos.65 Maduro’s administration has also sought to redirect attention amidst the ongoing criticism 
following the election.66 Human rights organizations are urging the UN to act to protect the Venezuelan civilian 
population, evaluate the results of the election and subsequent actions following the election results, and work to 

restore order in Venezuela.67  
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